
 

Charudat Charitable Trust  

Terms and Conditions 

Effective Date: 28/05/2025​
 

1. Introduction 

Welcome to Charudat Charitable Trust. These Terms and Conditions ("Terms") 
govern your use of our services, website, and participation in any activities we 
organize. By accessing our website or engaging with our initiatives, you agree to 
be bound by these Terms. 

 

2. Eligibility 

Participation in volunteering or donating is open to individuals aged 18 or above. 
Individuals under the age of 18 must obtain parental or guardian consent before 
engaging with our trust. 

 

3. Use of Website 

You agree to use our website and resources in a lawful manner. Any attempt to 
manipulate, damage, or misuse the platform will lead to immediate termination of 
access and possible legal consequences. 

 

 

 

 



4. Donations 

All donations made to Charudat Charitable Trust are voluntary and 
non-refundable. Funds received will be utilized exclusively for charitable 
purposes in alignment with the mission of the trust. Donation receipts will be 
provided upon request and are subject to applicable tax laws. 

 

5. Volunteer Responsibilities 

Volunteers are expected to maintain integrity, commitment, and respect while 
engaging in any charitable activity. Misbehavior, misconduct, or actions that 
tarnish the reputation of the trust may result in removal from all trust-related 
activities. 

 

6. Privacy 

Your personal information is important to us. By using our website or submitting 
forms, you agree to our Privacy Policy regarding the collection, storage, and 
usage of data. We do not share your information with third parties without your 
consent unless required by law. 

 

7. Limitation of Liability 

Charudat Charitable Trust shall not be liable for any direct, indirect, incidental, or 
consequential damages arising from the use of our services or participation in 
events, whether online or offline. 

 

 

 

 



8. Changes to Terms 

We reserve the right to update or modify these Terms at any time. Continued use 
of our website or services after changes indicates your acceptance of the 
updated terms. 

 

9. Governing Law 

These Terms shall be governed in accordance with the laws of India. Any 
disputes shall be subject to the jurisdiction of the courts located in Gujarat. 

 

10. Contact Us 

For questions or concerns regarding these Terms, you can contact us at: 

 

Charudat Charitable Trust​
 Phone: +91- 8866 5710 28​
 Email: charuduttacharity@gmail.com 
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